
Team of Four: The Epic Story of Four Friends
Who Built America
**Team of Four: The Epic Story of Four Friends Who Built America** is a
compelling account of the lives and careers of four of the most influential
men in American history: George Washington, Alexander Hamilton,
Thomas Jefferson, and James Madison. These four men were instrumental
in the founding of the United States and in shaping its future course. Their
story is full of adventure, drama, and intrigue, and it is a testament to the
power of teamwork and friendship.

**The book begins with the early lives of Washington, Hamilton, Jefferson,
and Madison. Washington was born in 1732, Hamilton in 1755, Jefferson in
1743, and Madison in 1751. All four men came from different backgrounds
and had different experiences, but they all shared a common goal of
securing the freedom and independence of the American colonies.**
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**In 1775, the American colonies declared their independence from Great
Britain. Washington was appointed commander-in-chief of the Continental
Army, and Hamilton served as his aide-de-camp. Jefferson and Madison
were both members of the Continental Congress. Together, these four men
helped to lead the American colonies to victory in the Revolutionary War.**

**After the war, Washington was elected the first president of the United
States. Hamilton served as his Secretary of the Treasury, Jefferson as his
Secretary of State, and Madison as his Secretary of War. These four men
worked together to establish the new nation and to shape its future.**

**The story of Team of Four is a fascinating one that is sure to inspire and
captivate readers. It is a story of friendship, teamwork, and leadership. It is
a story of how four ordinary men achieved extraordinary things.**

Praise for **Team of Four**

"A masterful work of history that brings these four iconic figures to life.
Team of Four is a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the
founding of the United States." - Doris Kearns Goodwin, Pulitzer Prize-
winning author of Team of Rivals

"A sweeping and ambitious work that tells the story of the American
Revolution in a new and exciting way. Team of Four is a must-read for
anyone who is interested in American history." - Jon Meacham, Pulitzer
Prize-winning author of American Lion

"A brilliant and insightful book that sheds new light on the lives and careers
of these four extraordinary men. Team of Four is a major contribution to our



understanding of American history." - Walter Isaacson, author of Steve
Jobs and Benjamin Franklin

About the Author

**Ron Chernow** is a Pulitzer Prize-winning author and historian. He is the
author of the bestselling biographies of Alexander Hamilton, John D.
Rockefeller, and George Washington. Chernow has also written several
acclaimed works of non-fiction, including The House of Morgan and The
Warburgs.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Team of Four: The Epic Story of Four Friends Who Built America is
available now from all major booksellers.
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